G:\M\I9\BOEBER\BOEBER_052.XML

[DISCUSSION DRAFT]

1191H CONGRESS
2D SESSION H. R.

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to modify and eliminate
certain taxes imposed under the National Firearms Act, and for other
purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Ms. BOEBERT introduced the following bill; which was referred to the
Committee on

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to modify
and eliminate certain taxes imposed under the National
Firearms Act, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Freedom from Taxes

5 B S S B O]

Act of 20267".

g:\V\G\041026\G041026.013.xml (105423112)
April 10, 2026 (11:49 a.m.)



G:\M\I9\BOEBER\BOEBER_052.XML

2
1 SEC. 2. AMENDMENTS TO THE NATIONAL FIREARMS ACT.
2 (a) ELIMINATION OF TRANSFER TAX.—Section
3 5811(a)(1) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
4 amended by striking “$200” and inserting “$0”.
5 (b)  ELIMINATION OF MAKING TAX.—Section
6 5821(a)(1) of such Code is amended by striking “$200”
7 and inserting “$0”.
8 (¢) EXEMPTION FrOM EXCISE TAX.—Section
9 4182(a) of such Code is amended by striking ‘“‘section
10 5811(a)(2)” and inserting “‘section 5811 (a)”.
11 (d) ELIMINATION OF SPECIAL TAX.—Section 5801
12 of such Code is amended by adding at the end the fol-
13 lowing new subsection:
14 “(¢) TiME Limrr.—The tax imposed by this section
15 shall not apply with respect to any year that begins after
16 the date on which this subsection takes effect.”.
17 (e) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The changes made by this
18 section shall take effect on the first day of the first cal-
19 endar quarter that begins after 90 days after the date of
20 the enactment of this Act.
g:\V\G\041026\G041026.013.xm (105423112)

April 10, 2026 (11:49 a.m.)




[DISCUSSION DRAFT]


		119th CONGRESS
2d Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to modify and eliminate certain taxes imposed under the National Firearms Act, and for other purposes.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Ms. Boebert introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________




A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to modify and eliminate certain taxes imposed under the National Firearms Act, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Freedom from Taxes Act of 2026”.


SEC. 2. Amendments to the National Firearms Act.

(a) Elimination of transfer tax.—Section 5811(a)(1) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking “$200” and inserting “$0”.


(b) Elimination of making tax.—Section 5821(a)(1) of such Code is amended by striking “$200” and inserting “$0”.


(c) Exemption from excise tax.—Section 4182(a) of such Code is amended by striking “section 5811(a)(2)” and inserting “section 5811(a)”.


(d) Elimination of special tax.—Section 5801 of such Code is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:


“(c) Time limit.—The tax imposed by this section shall not apply with respect to any year that begins after the date on which this subsection takes effect.”.


(e) Effective date.—The changes made by this section shall take effect on the first day of the first calendar quarter that begins after 90 days after the date of the enactment of this Act.






  
    G:\M\19\BOEBER\BOEBER_052.XML XXXXX XXXXX 4/10/2026 11:48 XXXXX 04/09/2026 3:40 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXX 
  1054231|2
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
    
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 119th CONGRESS  2d Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Ms. Boebert introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to modify and eliminate certain taxes imposed under the National Firearms Act, and for other purposes. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the  Freedom from Taxes Act of 2026. 
  2. Amendments to the National Firearms Act 
  (a) Elimination of transfer tax Section 5811(a)(1) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking  $200 and inserting  $0. 
  (b) Elimination of making tax Section 5821(a)(1) of such Code is amended by striking  $200 and inserting  $0. 
  (c) Exemption from excise tax Section 4182(a) of such Code is amended by striking  section 5811(a)(2) and inserting  section 5811(a). 
  (d) Elimination of special tax Section 5801 of such Code is amended by adding at the end the following new subsection: 
  
  (c) Time limit The tax imposed by this section shall not apply with respect to any year that begins after the date on which this subsection takes effect. . 
  (e) Effective date The changes made by this section shall take effect on the first day of the first calendar quarter that begins after 90 days after the date of the enactment of this Act. 
 


